TITLE _ —ELECTRICITY
Subtitle A —Amendmentsto the Federal Power Act

SEC.__01. DEFINITIONS.

(8) ELECTRIC UTILITY—Section 3(22) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 796(22)) is
amended to read as follows:

“(22) ‘eectric utility { DLD Comments > definition includes our dients, the APA and
Western!} means any person or Federd or State agency (including any municipality) that sells eectric
energy; such term includes the Tennessee Valley Authority and each Federa power marketing agency.”.

(b) TRANSMITTING UTILITY—Section 3(23) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 796(23)) is
amended to read asfollows:

“(23) transmitting utility’ means an entity (including any entity described in section 201(f)) thet
owns or operates fadlities used for the transmisson of eectric energy—

“(A) ininterstate commerce; or
“(B) for the sde of dectric energy a wholesdle” .{ DLD Comments > Includes EDS3,
ED4, ED5, SCIP, ED2 al have wholesale ddliveriesto APS}

(c) AbpiTioNAL DeriNITIONS—AL the end of section (3) of the Federal Power Act, add the
falowing:

“(26) ‘Regiond Transmisson Organization’ or ‘RTO’ means an entity of sufficient regiond
scope that meets the requirements of section 216 of the Act.

“(27) ' Independent Transmission Organization’ or ‘1TO” means an entity that is not of sufficient
regional scope, but otherwise meets the requirements of section 216 of the Act.

“(28) ‘load-serving entity means an eectric utility, trangmitting utility or Federal power
marketing agency that has an obligation under Federa, State, or loca law (including an entity described
in section 201(f) that exercises authority granted under such law), or an entity that holds firm
transmission rights or equivaent tradesble or financid transmisson rights as of the date of enactment of
this Act, to provide dectric service to either—

“(A) eectric consumers as defined in section 3(5) of the Public Utility Regulatory



Policies Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2602(5)); or

“(B) an entity described in section 201(f) or arura cooperative that has a service
obligation to provide eectric service to eectric consumers. { DLD Comment > assume this
definition includes our clients?}

“(29) * sarvice obligation meansalegd or contractua requirement applicable to, or the
exercise of authority granted to, aload-serving entity.”

“(30) ‘bundled retail sale of energy’ means a sale of eectric energy to a consumer, as described
in paragraph (28) or (29), where generation, transmission, distribution and other services necessary to
supply eectric energy to such consumers are sold asa single ddivered service by asingle sdler. A
service shdl be consdered to be sold asasingle ddlivered service if offered by the seller asasingle
product, even if each component and price thereof is stated separately on retail billing statementsin

accordance with applicable legd requirements.”

Subtitle B—Reliability (DLD Comments > it ismy
under standing that thislanguage is the language supported
by WECC and the Western Governor Association — provides
delegation of FERC authority to Electric Reliability
Organization —the WECC should qualify)

SEC._11. ELECTRIC RELIABILITY STANDARDS.
Part 11 of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824 & s2q.) is amended by adding the following:
“ELECTRIC RELIABILITY.
“Sec. 215. (a) For the purposes of this section:

“(1) The term *bulk-power system’ means—

“(A) facilities and control systems necessary for operating an interconnected
electric energy transmission network (or any portion thereof); and

“(B) dectric energy from generation facilities needed to maintain transmisson

sysem rdiability.



The term does not include facilities used in the local didtribution of eectric energy.

“(2) Theterms‘Electric Reiability Organization’ and ‘ERO’ mean the organization
certified by the Commission under subsection (), the purpose of which is to establish and
enforce reliability sandards for the bulk-power system, subject to Commission review.

“(3) Theterm ‘rdiability sandard’” means a requirement, gpproved by the Commission
under this section, to provide for reliable operation of the bulk-power system. The term includes
requirements for the operation of exigting bulk- power system facilities and the design of planned
additions or modifications to such facilities to the extent necessary to provide for religble
operation of the bulk-power system, but the term does not include any requirement to enlarge
such fadilities or to congtruct new transmission capacity or generation capacity.

“(4) Theterm ‘reliable operation’ means operating the dements of the bulk - power
system within equipment and dectric sysem thermd, voltage, and stability limits so that
ingability, uncontrolled separation, or cascading failures of such system will not occur as aresult
of a sudden disturbance or unanticipated failure of system eements.

“(5) Theterm ‘Interconnection’ means a geographic areain which the operation of
bulk-power system componentsis synchronized such that the failure of one or more of such
components may adversdly affect the ability of the operators of other components within the
system to maintain reliable operation of the facilities within their contral.

“(6) Theterm *transmission organization'’ meansan RTO , ITO or other transmission
organization finaly gpproved by the Commission for the operation of transmission facilities.

“(7) Theterm ‘regiond entity’ means an entity having enforcement authority pursuant to
subsection (€)(4).

“(b) The Commission shdl have jurisdiction, within the United States, over the ERO certified by
the Commission under subsection (c), any regiond entities, and al users, owners and operators of the
bulk- power system, including the entities described in section 201(f), for purposes of approving
reliability sandards established under this section and enforcing compliance with this section. All users,
owners and operators of the bulk - power system shal comply with religbility standards that take effect



under this section. The Commission shdl issue afind rule to implement the requirements of this section
not later than 180 days after the date of enactment of this section.

“(c) Following the issuance of a Commission rule under subsection (b)(2), any person may
submit an gpplication to the Commission for certification as the Electric Religbility Organization. The
Commission may certify one such ERO if the Commisson determines that such ERO—

“(1) hasthe ahility to develop and enforce, subject to subsection (€)(2), rdiability
gandards that provide for an adequate level of reliability of the bulk-power system;
“(2) has established rules that—

“(A) assure its independence of the users and owners and operators of the
bulk- power system, while assuring fair stakeholder representation in the selection of its
directors and baanced decisonmaking in any ERO committee or subordinate
organizetiond sructure;

“(B) dlocate equitably reasonable dues, fees, and other charges among end
usersfor dl activities under this section;

“(C) provide fair and impartia procedures for enforcement of reliability
standards through the impaosition of pendties in accordance with subsection (€)
(including limitations on activities, functions, or operations, or other gppropriate
sanctions);

“(D) provide for reasonable notice and opportunity for public comment, due
process, openness, and baance of interestsin developing rdiability standards and
otherwise exercigng its duties; and

“(E) provide for taking, after certification, appropriate stepsto gain recognition
in Canada and Mexico.

“(d)(1) The ERO shdl file each religbility standard or modification to a rdliability standard that it
proposes to be made effective under this section with the Commission.

“(2) The Commission may approve by rule or order a proposed reliability standard or
modification to ardiability sandard if it determines that the standard is just, reasonable, not unduly



discriminatory or preferentid, and in the public interest. The Commisson shdl give due weight to the
technical expertise of the ERO with respect to the content of a proposed standard or modification to a
reliability standard and to the technica expertise of aregiona entity organized on an Interconnection
wide basis with respect to ardiability sandard to be applicable within that Interconnection, but shall not
defer with respect to the effect of a standard on competition. A proposed standard or modification shall
take effect upon approva by the Commission.

“(3) The ERO shdl rebuttably presume that a proposad from aregiona entity organized on an
Interconnection-wide basis for ardiability slandard or modification to ardliability standard to be
gpplicable on an Interconnectiontwide basisisjus, reasonable, and not unduly discriminatory or
preferentid, and in the public interest.

“(4) The Commission shdl remand to the ERO for further consideration a proposed rdliability
gandard or a modification to areliability stlandard that the Commission disgpproves in whole or in part.

“(5) The Commisson, upon its own motion or upon complaint, may order the ERO to submit
to the Commission a proposed rdiability standard or a modification to a rdigbility standard that
addresses a specific matter if the Commission considers such anew or modified reiability sandard
appropriate to carry out this section.

“(6) Thefind rule adopted under subsection (b)(2) shall include fair processes for the
identification and timely resolution of any conflict between ardiability sandard and any function, rule,
order, tariff, rate schedule, or agreement accepted, approved, or ordered by the Commission agpplicable
to atransmisson organization. Such transmisson organization shal continue to comply with such
function, rule, order, tariff, rate schedue or agreement accepted approved, or ordered by the
Commission until—

“(A) the Commission finds a conflict exists between ardiability sandard and any such
provison;

“(B) the Commission orders a change to such provison pursuant to section 206 of this
part; and

“(C) the ordered change becomes effective under this part.



If the Commission determines that areliability standard needs to be changed as aresult of such a
conflict, it shal order the ERO to develop and file with the Commission amodified reliability sandard
under paragraph (4) or (5) of this subsection.

“(€)(1) The ERO may impose, subject to paragraph (2), a penalty on a user or owner or
operator of the bulk-power system for aviolation of areliability sandard approved by the Commission
under subsection (d) if the ERO, after notice and an opportunity for a hearing—

“(A) finds that the user or owner or operator has violated areliability standard
approved by the Commission under subsection (d); and
“(B) files notice and the record of the proceeding with the Commisson.

“(2) A penaty imposed under paragraph (1) may take effect not earlier than the 31st day after
the ERO files with the Commission notice of the pendty and the record of proceedings. Such pendty
shdl be subject to review by the Commission, on its own mation or upon gpplication by the user, owner
or operator that isthe subject of the pendty filed within 30 days after the date such notice isfiled with
the Commission. Application to the Commission for review, or the initiation of review by the
Commission on its own moation, shal not operate as a say of such pendty unless the Commission
otherwise orders upon its own mation or upon application by the user, owner or operator that isthe
subject of such pendlty. In any proceeding to review a penalty imposed under paragraph (1), the
Commission, after notice and opportunity for hearing (which hearing may consist solely of the record
before the ERO and opportunity for the presentation of supporting reasons to affirm, modify, or set
asde the pendty), shdl by order affirm, set aside, reindtate, or modify the penalty, and, if appropriate,
remand to the ERO for further proceedings. The Commission shdl implement expedited procedures for
such hearings.

“(3) On its own moation or upon complaint, the Commisson may order compliance with a
reliability standard and may impose a pendlty against a user or owner or operator of the bulk-power
system, if the Commission finds, after notice and opportunity for a hearing, that the user or owner or
operator of the bulk-power system has engaged or is about to engage in any acts or practices that
condtitute or will congtitute a violation of ardiability sandard.



“(4) The Commission shdl establish regulations authorizing the ERO to enter into an agreement
to delegate authority to aregiond entity for the purpose of proposing reliability standards to the ERO
and enforcing reliability sandards under paragraph (1) if—

“(A) the regiond entity is governed by an independent board, a balanced stakeholder
board, or a combination independent and balanced stakeholder board;
“(B) the regiond entity otherwise satisfies the provisons of subsection (¢)(1) and (2);
and
“(C) the agreement promotes effective and efficient administration of bulk - power
system rdidhility.
The Commission may modify such ddegation. The ERO and the Commission shdl rebuttably presume
that a proposa for delegation to aregiond entity organized on an Interconnection-wide basis promotes
effective and efficient adminigtration of bulk-power system reliability and should be approved. Such
regulation may provide that the Commisson may assgn the ERO' s authority to enforce rdiahility
gtandards under paragraph (1) directly to aregiond entity consstent with the requirements of this
paragraph.

“(5) The Commission may take such action asis necessary or appropriate against the ERO or a
regiond entity to ensure compliance with ardiability sandard or any Commission order affecting the
ERO or aregiond entity.

“(6) Any pendty imposed under this section shal bear a reasonable relation to the seriousness
of the violation and shall take into consderation the efforts of such user, owner, or operator to remedy
the violation in atimdy manner.

“(f) The ERO sndl file with the Commission for approval any proposed rule or proposed rule
change, accompanied by an explanation of its basis and purpose. The Commission, upon its own motion
or complaint, may propose a change to the rules of the ERO. A proposed rule or proposed rule change
shall take effect upon afinding by the Commission, after notice and opportunity for comment, thet the
changeisjugt, reasonable, not unduly discriminatory or preferentid, isin the public interest, and satisfies

the requirements of subsection (c).



“(g) The ERO shdl conduct periodic assessments of the reliability and adequacy of the bulk-
power system in North America.

“(h) The Presdent is urged to negotiate internationa agreements with the governments of
Canada and Mexico to provide for effective compliance with reiability standards and the effectiveness
of the ERO in the United States and Canada or Mexico.

“(i)(1) The ERO shdl have authority to develop and enforce compliance with religbility
gandards for only the bulk-power system.

“(2) This section does not authorize the ERO or the Commission to order the congtruction of
additional generation or transmission capacity or to set and enforce compliance with standards for
adequacy or safety of dectric facilities or services.

“(3) Nothing in this section shdl be construed to preempt any authority of any State to take
action to ensure the safety, adequacy, and reliability of eectric service within that State, aslong as such
action is not incongstent with any reliability standard.

“(4) Within 90 days of the application of the ERO or other affected party, and after notice and
opportunity for comment, the Commission shal issue afina order determining whether a State action is
inconggtent with ardiability standard, taking into consderation any recommendation of the ERO.

“(5) The Commisson, after consultation with the ERO, may Stay the effectiveness of any State
action, pending the Commission’ s issuance of afind order.

“(j) The Commission shdl establish aregiona advisory body on the petition of at least two-
thirds of the States within a region that have more than one-haf of their dectric load served within the
region. A regiond advisory body shal be composed of one member from each participating State in the
region, appointed by the Governor of each State, and may include representatives of agencies, States,
and provinces outside the United States. A regiond advisory body may provide advice to the ERO, a
regiond entity, or the Commission regarding the governance of an existing or proposed regiona entity
within the same region, whether a sandard proposed to apply within the region is just, reasonable, not
unduly discriminatory or preferentia, and in the public interest, whether fees proposed to be assessed
within the region are jug, reasonable, not unduly discriminatory or preferentia, and in the public interest



and any other respongihilities requested by the Commission. The Commission may give deferenceto the
advice of any such regiona advisory body if that body is organized on an Interconnection-wide basis.
“(k) The provisons of this section do not apply to Alaskaor Hawaii.”.

Subtitle C - Federal Power Act Jurisdiction Clarification
and Standard Market Design | mplementation

SeEc.__21. CLARIFICATION OF JURISDICTION UNDER THE FEDERAL POWER ACT.

Section 201(a) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824(a)) is amended by adding at the end:
“The authorities granted to the Commission shall not extend to the transmission rate component of any
bundled retail sde of energy.”

SEC.__ 22. IMPLEMENTATION DATE FOR PROPOSED RULEMAKING ON STANDARD MARKET DESIGN.

No fina order shall be issued by the Commission in Docket No. RM01-12-000 prior to January
1, 2005.

Subtitle D — Flexible Market Design

SEC. _ 31. SENSE OF THE CONGRESS ON REGIONAL TRANSMISSION ORGANIZATIONS.
It isthe sense of Congressthat, in order to promote fair, open accessto eectric transmission

sarvice, benefit retal consumers, facilitate wholesale competition, improve efficiencies in transmisson
grid management, promote grid reliability, remove opportunities for unduly discriminatory or preferentia
transmission practices, and provide for the efficient development of transmission infrastructure needed to
mest the growing demands of competitive wholesde power markets, al trangmitting utilitiesin intergate
commerce should become members of independently administered Regiond Transmisson Organizations
(“RTQ") that have operationd or functiond control of facilities used for the transmission of eectric
energy in interstate commerce and do not own or control generation facilities used to supply dectric

energy for sde at wholesde.
SEC.__32. FEDERAL UTILITY PARTICIPATION IN REGIONAL TRANSMISSION ORGANIZATIONS—

(a) DerFINITIONS—FoOr purposes of this section:

(1) Theterm “appropriate Federd regulatory authority” means—



(A) with respect to a Federd power marketing agency, the Secretary of

Energy, except that the Secretary may designate the Administrator of a Federa power

marketing agency to act as the appropriate Federal regulatory authority with respect to

the transmission system of that Federd power marketing agency; and
(B) with respect to the Tennessee Vdley Authority, the Board of Directors of
the Tennessee Vdley Authority.

(2) Theterm **Federd utility” means a Federal power marketing agency or the
Tennessee Vdley Authority. DLD Comment > I’'m assuming/hoping this definitions excludes
SCIP and CRA!

(3) Theterm “‘tranamission system’” means eectric transmission facilities owned,
leased, or contracted for by the United States and operated by a Federd Utility.

(b) TRANSFER.—The gppropriate Federal regulatory authority is authorized to enter into a
contract, agreement or other arrangement transferring control and use of dl or part of the Federa
utility’ stransmission sysemto an RTO or ITO, as defined in sections 3(26) and 3(27) of the Federa
Power Act . Such contract, agreement or arrangement shal include—

(1) performance standards for operation and use of the transmission system that the
head of the Federd utility determines necessary or gppropriate, including standards that assure
recovery of al the Federd utility’s costs and expenses related to the transmission facilities that
are the subject of the contract, agreement or other arrangement, consstency with exigting
contracts and third- party financing arrangements, and consistency with said Federd utility’s
datutory authorities, obligations, and limitations;

(2) provisons for monitoring and oversight by the Federd utility of the RTO or ITO’s
fulfillment of the terms and conditions of the contract, agreement or other arrangement, including
aprovison that may provide for the resolution of disputes through arbitration or other means
with the RTO or ITO or with other participants, notwithstanding the obligations and limitations
of any other law regarding arbitration; and

(3) aprovison that alows the Federd utility to withdraw from the RTO or ITO and

10



terminate the contract, agreement or other arrangement in accordance with its terms.
Neither this section, actions taken pursuant to it, nor any other transaction of a Federd utility using an
RTO or ITO shdl serve to confer upon the Federd Energy Regulatory Commission jurisdiction or
authority over the Federa utility’s electric generation assets, eectric capacity or energy that the Federa
utility is authorized by law to market, or the Federd utility’s power sdes activities.

() EXISTING STATUTORY AND OTHER OBLIGATIONS—

(1) Any gatutory provision requiring or authorizing a Federd Utility to transmit eectric
power or to construct, operate or maintain its transmission system shal not be construed to
prohibit atransfer of control and use of its tranamisson system pursuant to, and subject to all
requirements of paragraph (2).

(2) This subsection shdl not be construed to—

(A) suspend, or exempt any Federd utility from, any provison of existing

Federd law, including but not limited to any requirement or direction relating to the use

of the Federd utility’ s transmisson system, environmenta protection, fish and wildlife

protection, flood control, navigation, water delivery, or recrestion; or
(B) authorize abrogation of any contract or tresty obligation.

SEC._33.REGIONAL TRANSMISSION ORGANIZATION REQUIREMENTS.
Part |1 of the Federal Power Act isamended by adding the following:
“TRANSMISSION ORGANIZATION CRITERIA
“Sec. 216. An RTO and, as appropriate, an 1TO, shal meet of the following criteria

“(1) AnRTO and ITO shdl be independent of dl market participants.

“(2) AnRTO and ITO shdl oversee or control interstate transmission facilitieswithin a
gpecific region in such manner as will remove opportunities for unduly discriminatory or
preferentia transmission practices, congstent with section 218,

“(3) AnRTO and ITO may own transmisson facilities, operate transmission facilities
owned by other entities, or oversee the operation of transmission facilities owned by other

entities.

11



“(4) AnRTO or ITO not within an RTO region shdl have the exclusve authority for
maintaining the short-term reliability of the transmission grid it controls, operates or oversees,
subject to section 215 of the Act.

“(5) AnRTO in conjunction with any relevant ITO and an ITO not within an RTO
region shal be the provider of transmisson service and the sole administrator of anorr
discriminatory wholesde open access tariff for the facilities under its ownership, control or
oversight.

“(6) An RTO in conjunction with any relevant ITO and an ITO not within an RTO
region shdl develop market mechanisms for identifying and managing congestion, but such
mechanisms need not be based upon locationd margind pricing. DLD Comment > this
language may not stop FERC from its LMP directive — once the RTO is formed they are on the
dippery dope — FERC will claim other congestion management tools are discriminator — can
language be strengthen to exclude or limit FERC' s authority to force LMP ... .but such
mechanisms must be nondiscriminatory and FERC is prohibited from mandating locationa
margind pricing’.

“(7) An RTO in conjunction with any relevant ITO and an ITO not within an RTO
region shal implement procedures to address pardld path flows.

“(8) An RTO in conjunction with any rdlevant ITO and an ITO not within an RTO
region shall operate a single open access same time information system for dl transmisson
facilities under its ownership, control or oversght and shdl caculate total transmission capacity
and avallable transmisson capacity, or the equivaent transmisson rightsif its congestion
management system is based upon financid rather than physica rights.

“(99 An RTO and an ITO not within an RTO region shall ensure that a market for
ancdillary servicesisavalable. DLD Comment > ancillary services includes balancing energy —
again the dippery dope — once realtime balancing energy markets exist it will be difficult to sop
FERC mandating LMP in order to ensure non-discriminatory ancillary services markets.

“(10) An RTO in conjunction with any relevant ITO or an ITO not withinan RTO

12



region shdl provide for monitoring of wholesale eectric energy markets and ancillary services
within its region, working with the Commission, States, and other gppropriate entities.

“(11) An RTO shdl conduct or coordinate regiond planning, or if itisan ITO it shdl
participate in regiond planning, working with stakeholders, appropriate State regulatory
authorities, the Commission, and the Department of Energy to identify and encourage needed
cost- effective expansons of transmisson capacity, remova of transmission congraints, and
gting of generation facilities.

“(12) An RTO and ITO shdl facilitate non-discriminatory scheduling and
interconnection arrangements on the transmission grid it operates or oversees.

“(13) An RTO and ITO shdl provide participating eectric and tranamitting utilities and
other entities that have incurred costs in forming the RTO or ITO an opportunity to recover al
legitimate, verifiable, prudently incurred costs of forming the RTO or ITO.

“(14) AnRTO and ITO shdl provide aplan to diminate the practice of assessng
multiple, cumulative charges for transmission service across successive locations (known as
“pancaked rates’). DLD Comment > this provisons heps TDUs but | believe will cause
Western, SRP and others heartburn!

“(15) AnRTO and ITO shdl ensure that ared time dectricity market is available and
may provide for aday ahead dectricity market or such other dectricity market as it deems
appropriate.

“(16) An RTO and ITO shdl coordinate its activities with tranamitting utilities overseeing
or controlling adjacent interdate transmisson facilities.

“(17) AnRTO and ITO shdl provide a plan on how to alocate costs associated with
new tranamission facilities as well as modification, expanson or upgrade of existing tranamission
facilities (*transmisson expansion”) that will ensure that costs of any tranamisson expanson are
dlocated fairly and that those who pay for transmisson expansion are credited with some
proportionate transmission service that reflects the amount invested in the transmission

expangon or equivaent tradegble or financia transmisson rights.

13



“(18) An RTO and ITO shdl provide a plan to ensure that—

“(A) any load-serving entity under its control (DLD Comment > what is*“under
its control” are the digtricts by virtue of their interconnection to a transmission provider
who is under the RTO control included or excluded? If excluded we need the same
protections) or oversght shal be entitled to use firmtransmission rights or equivalent
tradesble or financid transmission rights to meet its current and reasonably forecasted
service obligations,

“(B) any load-serving entity under its control or oversght shal be afforded afair
opportunity to make any necessary reservations of transmission capacity to exercise
firm trangmission rights or equivaent tradeable or financid rights to meet current and
reasonably forecasted service obligatiorns;

“(C) to the extent that al or a portion of aload-serving entity' s service
obligationis transferred to another load- serving entity, the successor shall be entitled to
use firm trangmisson rights, if they were available to the transferor, or equivalent
tradesble or financid transmission rights associated with the transferred service
obligation Subsequent transfers to another load-serving entity, or back to the origina

load-serving entity, shdl be entitled to the samerrights.
“LIMITATIONS ON COMMISSION AUTHORITY

“Sec. 217. (a) Inany rule or order, including the fina rule on the Standard Market Designin

Docket No. RM01-12-000, or any action on an individua application to form or modify an RTO or

ITO after the date of enactment of this section the Commission shal comply with the requirements of

this section and section 216.
“(b) If an gpplicant files aproposd to establish, participate in or modify an RTO or ITO with

the Commission and if such application meets the requirements of the preceding section and other

applicable requirements of Section 205 of this Act to the extent consistent with this section and the

preceding section, the Commission shdl promptly approve the gpplication.

“(c) In exercising its authority, the Commission shdl permit applicants to retain the maximum

practicable flexibility in structuring and implementing RTOs and ITOs. In carrying out this requirement,

14



the Commisson sdl—

“(1) permit organizationa forms of for-profit, not-for-profit or any variation thereof to
operate RTOs and ITOs or operate within RTOs;

“(2) permit RTOs and ITOs to phase-in the implementation of the gpplicable
requirements so as to best meet the needs of aregion, and in particular shdl take into account
the specia circumstances that may be found in the Western Interconnection related to the
existence of transmission congestion; the existence of sgnificant hydrodectric capacity; the
participation of unregulated transmitting utilities; and the distances between generation and |oad;
and

“(3) make a finding with respect to each RTO and ITO order that the Commission
has—

“(A) taken into account legd, financia, and operationd congtraints faced by
particular types of gpplicants and participants, including public utilities, entities described
in section 201(f), and rurd cooperative utilities,

“(B) addressed the concerns of State regulatory authorities and other
appropriate State authorities in States in which the RTO and ITO operates, and

“(C) provided for economicdly efficient invesment in transmisson infrastructure
to support the development of regiona wholesale markets for eectric power.

“(d) The Commission shdl not require directly, or as a condition of its approva of (1) any
gpplication to form or participate in an RTO or (2) any application to provide independent control or
oversght of transmission fadilities, that a public utility divest generation or transmission facilities.

“(e) The Commission shdl not interfere with atranamitting utility’ s right to develop, congtruct
and own system expansions to ensure adequate and reliable service.

“DEFERENCE REQUIREMENT

“Sec. 218. (a) In exercigng itsjurisdiction under this Part to act on matters concerning
formation or modification of an RTO or an ITO, the Commission shdl give substantial deference to any
agreement by State regulatory authorities, other appropriate State officials, and stakeholders of the

15



RTO or ITO on issues concerning—
“(1) dlocation of the cogts of new transmission and interconnection facilities;
“(2) equitable dlocation of the fixed cogts of the exigting system, including the impaosition
of rates for transmission service through and out of an RTO or ITO;
“(3) the ahility of load-serving entities to meet service obligations, as described in
paragraph 18 of section 216; and
“(4) the ability of States and public utilities regulated by States to perform integrated
resource planning for the benefit of retail cusomers.
(b) The Commission shdl provide any trangmitting utility thet participatesinan RTO or an ITO an
opportunity to recover dl legitimate, verifigble, prudently incurred costs incurred forming, joining and
participating in the RTO or ITO, including revenues lost due to its participation inthe RTO or ITO for a
reasonable trangtion period. DLD Comment > what about lost revenues from non-participating or

unwelcome transmission providers
“EXCEPTION.
“Sec. 219. Nothing in sections 216, 217 and 218 shal gpply to any entity referred to in section

212(k)(2)(B) of the Federa Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824(k)(2)(B)).”
SEC.__34. SERVICE OBLIGATION SECURITY AND PARITY.
Section 206 of the Federa Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824e) is amended by adding the following:

“(e) A load-sarving entity shdl be entitled to use firm transmission rights or equivaent tradegble

or financia transmission rights to meet its current and reasonably forecasted service obligation.

16



“(f) To the extent that dl or aportion of aload-serving entity' s service obligationis transferred
to another |oad- serving entity, the successor shdl be entitled to use firm transmission rights, if they were
available to the trandferor, or equivaent tradegble or financid transmission rights associated with the
transferred service obligation  Subsequent transfers to anotherl oad-serving entity, or back to the
origind load-serving entity, shall be entitled to the samerights.  “(g) To the extent atranamitting utility
that is not part of an RTO or an ITO reserves tranamission capacity or reserves the equivaent tradesble
or finandd transmission rights to meet any service obligation and affords load- serving entitiesthat rely
on that tranamitting utility’ s facilities comparable rights to do the same, that tranamitting utility shal not be
consdered as engaging in undue discrimination or preference under the Act.

“(h) Any sde of dectric energy by aload-serving entity to a buyer other than those described in
section 3(28)(A) and (B)of the Federd Power Act must be consistent with section 205 and 206 of the
Federal Power Act.

“(1) Nothing in this section shdl affect the dlocation of transmisson rightsby an RTO or ITO
gpproved by the Commission before the enactment of this subsection. Nothing in this section shall
provide abasisfor abrogating any contract for firm transmisson service or rightsin effect as of the date
of the enactment of this subsection.” DLD Comments > WestConnect status as an approved RTO by
the Commission needs to be fully evauated — if WestConnect is an approved RTO then the load-
serving entities protection is limited to what WestConnect has aready done or will do—a aminimum

revisons to RTOs dlocation of transmission rights need to be tested againgt these provisions.
SEC. _ 35. REGIONAL CONSIDERATION OF COMPETITIVE WHOLESALE MARKETS,
(8@ Within 3 months of enactment of this Act, the Commission shdl convene regiond discussions

with State regulatory commissions, as defined in section 3(21) of the Federd Power Act, viapublic
hearings or technical conferences, and following natice to the public and the opportunity for interested
parties to comment on and to participate in such discussions. The regiona discussions should address
whether wholesale eectric markets in each region are working effectively to provide rdigble service to
electric consumersin the region at the lowest reasonable cogt. Priority should be given to discussonsin
regions that do not have, as of the date of enactment of this Act, a Regiona Transmission Organization
or an Independent Transmission Organization, respectively defined in section 3(26) and section 3(27) of

17



the Federd Power Act. Theregiond discussions shdl consider—

(1) the need for an independent regiond transmission organizetion or organizationsin the
region to provide non-discriminatory transmission access and generation interconnection;

(2) aprocessfor regiond planning of transmisson facilities with State regulatory
authority participation and for consderation of multi-state projects,

(3) ameans for ensuring that costs for dl eectric consumers, as defined in section 3(5)
of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2602(5)), and buyers of
wholesale energy or capacity are reasonable and economicaly efficient;

(4) ameansfor ensuring that al eectric consumers, as defined in section 3(5) of the
Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2602(5)), and other customers who
have exiging contracts for dectric service within the region maintain their ability to usethe
exiging transmission system without incurring unreasonable additional costs in order to expand
the tranamisson system for new customers;

(5) whether the integrated transmission and electric power supply system can and
should be operated in a manner that schedules and economicaly prioritizes dl available eectric
generation resources, o as to minimize the costs of dectric energy to al consumers (“economic
digoatch”) and maintaining system reiability;

(6) ameansto provide trangparent price sgnds to ensure efficient expanson of the
electric sysem and efficiently manage transmission congestion;

(7) diminating in a reasonable manner, consistent with gpplicable State and Federd law,
multiple, cumulative charges for transmisson service across successive locations within aregion
(“pancaked rates’);

(8) resolution of seamsissues with neighboring regions and inter-regiona coordination;

(9) ameans of providing information dectronicaly to potentid users of the transmisson
Sysem;

(10) implementation of a market monitor for the region with State regulatory authority
and Commission oversight and establishment of rules and procedures that ensure that State

18



regulatory authorities are provided access to market information and that provides for expedited

consideration by the Commission of any complaints concerning exercise of market power and

the operation of wholesale markets; and,

(11) atimetable to meet the objectives of this section.

(b) Within 12 months of enactment of this Act, the Commission shdl report to Congress on the
progress made in addressing the issues in subsection () of this Section in discussions with the States.

(©) Nothing in this Section shal affect any discussions between the Commission and State or
other retail regulatory authorities that are on-going prior to enactment of this Act.

Subtitle E—Improving Transmission Access and

Infrastructure
SEC.__41. OPEN NON-DISCRIMINATORY ACCESS.
Part 11 of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824 et seq.) isamended by inserting after section

211 the following:
“OPEN ACCESSBY UNREGULATED TRANSMITTING UTILITIES
“Sec. 211A. (a) Subject to section 212(h), the Commission may, by rule or order, require an

unregulated trangmitting utility to provide transmission services—
“(1) a rates that are comparable to those that the unregulated transmitting utility charges
itsdlf; and
“(2) on terms and conditions (not relating to rates) that are comparable to those under
which such unregulated transmitting utility provides transmission servicesto itsdf and that are not
unduly discriminatory or preferentid.
“(b) The Commission shal exempt from any rule or order under this subsection any unregulated
tranamitting utility that—
“(1) isafacility used in loca didribution that a sells no more than 4,000,000 megawait
hours of eectricity per year; or  DLD Comments > understand this provison but believe its of
little value, if the larger transmission providers are forced into RTOs than the game is over > we

al are paying for the CA 1S0 even though we are not members. This section may provide a

19



delay but FERC will makeit so difficult to Stay out that the smdler systemswill be forced in —

game over! In addition it appears that our clients are subject to the other provisions on the hill

as “load serving entity’s” and “eectric utilities’ — am | missng something.
“(2) does not own or operate any transmission facilities that are necessary for
operating an interconnected transmission system (or any portion thereof); or
“(3) meets other criteriathe Commission determines to be in the public interest.

“(c) The rate changing procedures applicable to public utilities under subsections (c) and (d) of
section 205 are applicable to unregulated transmitting utilities for purposes of this section.

“(d) In exercigng its authority under paragraph (1) of subsection (a), the Commisson may
remand transmission rates to an unregulated tranamitting utility for review and revison where necessary
to meet the requirements of subsection ().

“(e) The provision of transmission services under subsection (8) does not preclude arequest for
transmission services under section 211.

“(f) The Commission may not require a State or municipdity to take action under this section
that condtitutes a private business use for purposes of section 141 of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986 (26 U.S.C. 141).

“(g) For purposes of this subsection, the term * unregulated transmitting utility’ means an entity
that—

“(1) owns or operates facilities used for the transmisson of eectric energy in interstate
commerce, and

“(2) iseither an entity described in section 201(f) or arurd dectric cooperdtive.”.
SEC._42. TRANSMISSION INFRASTRUCTURE INVESTMENT.
Part |1 of the Federal Power Act isamended by adding the following:
“SUSTAINABLE TRANSMISSION NETWORKS RULEMAKING
“Sec. 220. (a) Within 6 months of the enactment of this section, the Commission shal establish,

by rule, transmission pricing policies and standards for promoting the expanson and improvement of
interstate transmission networks through incentive-based, performance-based, participant-funded and
cost of service-based rate treatments to ensure rdiability of the electric system, to support interstate

20



wholesale markets for eectric power, and expand transmission transfer capacity needed to sustain
wholesale competition. Policies and standards established under this section shdl be gpplicableto all
public utilities, be congstent with section 205 of this Act; and, specificaly—

“(21) promote capital invesment in the economically efficient enlargement of transmisson
networks to reduce congestion on transmission networks and provide assurance that new
generaion and transmission is built where it provides the lowest overall cost to consumers;

“(2) encourage improved operation of transmission facilities and deployment of
transmission technologies to increase capacity and efficiency of existing networks and reduce
line loses, induding but not limited to high-cgpacity wires (including high-temperature
superconducting cables), power dectronics and information technologies (including flexible
dternaing current transmission system technologies), and high-voltage, direct current lines,

“(3) provide areturn on equity that attracts new investment in transmission facilities and
reasonably reflects the financial, operationa and other risks taken by public utilitiesin
restructuring transmission assets, and

“(4) reward improved qudity of transmisson service.

“(b) In the case of any transmisson rate gpproved by the Commission on or &fter the effective
date of the rule established under this section, the rate shall comply with the procedura and other
requirements of this part, including the requirement of sections 205 and 206, thet al rates, charges,

terms and conditions be just and reasonable and not unduly discriminatory.”.
SEC.__43. INFRASTRUCTURE COST ALLOCATION PRINCIPLE.
(8 Within one year after the enactment of this Act, the Commission shdl issue afind rule

regarding the alocation of costs associated with the interconnection of new transmission facilities aswell
as the modification, expansion or upgrade of exigting trangmisson facilities (“transmission expansion”)
for facilities thet are not within an RTO or ITO.

(b) Thefind rule shdl ensure that the cods of any transmisson expansion are alocated in such a
way that dl users of the transmission expanson bear the gppropriate share of its cods.

(©) Inits rulemaking, the Commission shdl consider system-wide benefits as benefits that
include, but are not limited to projects that—

21



(2) provide reiability and adequacy for regiond needs,
(2) accommodate load growth on aregiond leve;
(3) increase transmission cgpability into congested aress, and
(4) facilitate maor regiond and inter-regiona power transfers (seams).
(d) The cost of tranamission expansion projects that do not provide sufficient system-wide
benefits but rather benefit only a subset of users or market participants shal be recovered from that
subset on an incremental basis.

Subtitle F—Amendmentsto the Public Utility Regulatory
Policies Act of 1978

SEC._ 51. NET METERING.
(a) AboprTioN oF STANDARD.—Section 111(d) of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of

1978 (16 U.S.C. 2621(d)) is amended by adding at the end the following:
“(11) NET METERING.—

“(A) Each dectric utility shdl make available upon request net metering service
to any eectric consumer that the dectric utility serves.

“(B) For purposes of implementing this paragraph, any reference contained in
this section to the date of enactment of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of
1978 shdl be deemed to be areference to the date of enactment of this paragraph.

“(C) Notwithstanding subsections (b) and (c) of section 112, each State
regulatory authority shall consder and make a determination concerning whether it is
appropriate to implement the standard set out in subparagraph (A) not later than 1 year
after the date of enactment of this paragraph.”.

(b) SPeciAL RuLEsFOR NET METERING.—Section 115 of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies
Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2625) is further amended by adding at the end the following:

“(i) NeT METERING.—In undertaking the consideration and making the determination under
section 111 with respect to the standard concerning net metering established by section 111(d)(13), the

22



term net metering service shdl mean aservice provided in accordance with the following sandards.

“(1) An éectric utility—

“(A) shdl charge the owner or operator of an on-Ste generating fecility rates
and chargesthat areidentical to those that would be charged other eectric consumers
of the eectric utility in the same rate class; and

“(B) shall not charge the owner or operator of an onSte generating facility any
additiona standby, capacity, interconnection, or other rate or charge. DLD Comment >
thiswill cause problems — will force transmission charges away from capecity
reservation to an energy determinate, other wise alarge users may be able to avoid
transmission charges by operating on-sight generation for avery limited amount of
hours.

“(2) An dectric utility that sells electric energy to the owner or operator of an on-Site
generating facility shal measure the quantity of eectric energy produced by the on-stefadlity
and the quantity of eectric energy consumed by the owner or operator of an on-Ste generating
facility during a billing period in accordance with norma metering practices.

“(3) If the quantity of dectric energy sold by the dectric utility to an on-Ste generating
facility exceeds the quantity of dectric energy supplied by the on-Ste generating facility to the
electric utility during the billing period, the dectric utility may bill the owner or operator for the
net quantity of dectric energy sold, in accordance with norma metering practices.

“(4) If the quantity of dectric energy supplied by the on-gte generating facility to the
electric utility exceeds the quantity of ectric energy sold by the dectric utility to the on-ste
generating facility during the billing period—

“(A) the dectric utility may bill the owner or operator of the on-Ste generating
facility for the appropriate charges for the billing period in accordance with paragraph
(2); and

“(B) the owner or operator of the on-Ste generating facility shal be credited for
the excess kilowatt- hours generated during the billing period, with the kilowatt- hour

23



credit gppearing on the bill for the following billing period.

“(5) An digible on-gte generating facility and net metering system used by an dectric
consumer shdl meet dl gpplicable safety, performance, reliability, and interconnection standards
established by the Nationa Electrica Code, the Ingtitute of Electrica and Electronics Engineers,
and Underwriters Laboratories.

“(6) The Commission, after consultation with State regulatory authorities and
unregulated electric utilities and after notice and opportunity for comment, may adopt, by rule,
additional control and testing requirements for on-Ste generating facilities and net metering
systems that the Commission determines are necessary to protect public safety and system
reiability.

“(7) For purposes of this subsection—

“(A) Theterm ‘digible on-gte generating facility’ means—

“(i) afacility on the Ste of aresdentia eectric consumer with a
maximum generating cgpacity of 10 kilowatts or less that is fueled by solar
energy, wind energy, or fuel cels; or

“(ii) afacility on the dte of acommercid dectric consumer with a
maximum generating capacity of 500 kilowatts or lessthat isfueled soldy by a
renewable energy resource, landfill gas, or ahigh efficiency system.

“(B) Theterm ‘renewable energy resource’ means solar, wind, biomass, or
geotherma energy.

“(C) Theterm ‘high efficiency sysem’ meansfud cells or combined heat and
power.

“(D) Theterm ‘net metering service’: means service to an ectric consumer
under which electric energy generated by that eectric consumer from an digible on-Ste
generating facility and delivered to the locd digtribution facilities may be used to offset
electric energy provided by the dectric utility to the eectric consumer during the
goplicable billing period.”.

SEC. _52. REAL-TIME PRICING AND TIME-OF-USE METERING STANDARDS.

24



(8) AbopPTiON OF STANDARDS—Section 111(d) of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of
1978 (16 U.S.C. 2621(d)) is amended by adding at the end the following:
“(12) REAL-TIME PRICING.—

“(A) Each dectric utility shdll, at the request of an eectric consumer, provide
electric service under ared-time rate schedule, under which the rate charged by the
eectric utility varies by the hour (or smdler time interval) according to changesin the
electric utility' s wholesale power cost. The red-time pricing service shdl endble the
electric consumer to manage energy use and cost through real-time metering and
communications technology.

“(B) For purposes of implementing this paragraph, any reference contained in
this section to the date of enactment of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of
1978 shdl be deemed to be areference to the date of enactment of this paragraph.

“(C) Notwithstanding subsections (b) and (¢) of section 112, each State
regulatory authority shall consider and make a determination concerning whether it is
gppropriate to implement the standard set out in subparagraph (A) not later than 1 year
after the date of enactment of this paragraph.

““(13) TIME-OF-USE METERING.—

“(A) Each dectric utility shdl, a the request of an electric consumer, provide
electric service under atime-of-use rate schedule which enables the electric consumer
to manage energy use and cost through time- of-use metering and technology.

“(B) For purposes of implementing this paragraph, any reference contained in
this section to the date of enactment of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of
1978 shdll be deemed to be areference to the date of enactment of this paragraph.

“(C) Notwithstanding subsections (b) and (c) of section 112, each State
regulatory authority shal consder and make a determination concerning whether it is
gppropriate to implement the standards set out in subparagraph (A) not later than 1 year
after the date of enactment of this paragraph.”.

25



(b) SPeciAL RuLEs.—Section 115 of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16
U.S.C. 2625) is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(j) REAL-TIME PricING.—INn a State that permits third-party marketersto sdll eectric energy
to retail eectric consumers, the dectric consumer shdl be entitled to receive the same real-time metering
and communication service as adirect retail eectric consumer of the eectric
utility.

“(k) TiIME-OF-USE METERING.—INn a State that permits third-party marketers to sell eectric
energy to retail eectric consumers, the eectric consumer shdl be entitled to receive the same
time-of-use metering and communication service as adirect retall dectric consumer of the eectric
utility.”.

SEC._ 53 SMART METERING.

(& IN GENERAL.—Section 111(d) of the Public Utilities Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16
U.S.C. 2621(d)) is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(14) TIME-BASED METERING AND COMMUNICATIONS.—

“(A) Each dectric utility shal offer each of its customer classes, and provide
individual customers upon customer request, atime-based rate schedule under which
the rate charged by the eectric utility varies during different time periods and reflects the
variance in the cods of generating and purchasing dectricity a thewholesdelevd. The
time-based rate schedule shal enable the e ectric consumer to manage energy use and
cost through advanced metering and communi cations technology.

“(B) The types of time-based rate schedules that may be offered under the
schedule referred to in subparagraph (A) include, among others, each the following:

“(i) Time-Of-Use pricing whereby eectricity prices are set for a specific
time period on an advance or forward basis, typically not changing more often
than twice ayear. Prices paid for energy consumed during these periods shdl
be pre-established and known to consumers in advance of such consumption,
dlowing them to vary their demand and usage in response to such prices and
manage their energy costs by shifting usage to alower cost period or reducing

26



their consumption overdl.

“(ii) Critical Pesk Pricing whereby time-of-use prices are in effect
except for certain peak days, when prices may reflect the costs of generating
and purchasing eectricity a the wholesde level and when consumers may
recelve additiond discounts for reducing pesk period energy consumption.

“(iii) Red- Time pricing whereby eectricity prices are set for a specific
time period on an advanced or forward basis and may change as often as
hourly.

“(C) Each dectric utility subject to subparagraph (A) shal provide each
customer requesting atime-based rate with a time-based meter capable of enabling the
utility and customer to offer and receive such rate, respectively.

“(D) For purposes of implementing this paragraph, any reference contained in
this section to the date of enactment of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of
1978 shdll be deemed to be areference to the date of enactment of this paragraph.

“(E) In a State that permits third- party marketers to sdll electric energy to retall
electric consumers, such consumers shdl be entitled to receive that same time-based
metering and communications device and service as aretall dectric consumer of the
eectric utility.

“(F) Notwithstanding subsections (b) and (c) of section 112, each State
regulatory authority shal, not later than twelve (12) months after enactment of this
paragraph conduct an investigation in accordance with section 115(i) and issue a
decison whether it is appropriate to implement the standards set out in subparagraphs
(A)and (C).".

(b) STATE INVESTIGATION OF DEMAND RESPONSE AND TIME-BASED METERING.—Section 115
of the Public Utilities Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2625) is amended by adding the a
the end the following:

“(k) TiIME-BASED METERING AND COMMUNICATIONS—Each State regulatory authority shdll

27



conduct an investigation and issue a decison whether or not it is gppropriate for dectric utilitiesto
provide and ingd| time-based meters and communications devices for each of their customers which
enable such customersto participate in time-based pricing rate schedules and other demand response
programs.”.

(c) FEDERAL AssISTANCE ON DEMAND REsPoNSE.—Section 132(a) of the Public Utility
Regulatory Polices Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2642(a)) is amended by striking “and” at the end of
paragraph (3), striking the period at the end of paragraph (4) and inserting “; and”,
and by adding the following at the end thereof:

“(5) technologies, techniques and rate-making methods related to advanced metering
and communications and the use of these technologies, techniques and methods in demand
response programs.”.

(d) FeperaL GuibANCE.—Section 132 of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 1978
(16 U.S.C. 2643) is amended by adding the following at the end thereof:

“(d) DeEmAND ResPoNse.—The Secretary shdl be responsible for each of the following:

“(1) Educating consumers on the availability, advantages and benefits of advanced
metering and communications technologies including the funding of demondration or pilot
projects.

“(2) Working with States, utilities, other energy providers and advanced metering and
communications experts to identify and address barriers to the adoption of demand response
programs, and

“(3) Within 6 months of enactment, provide the Congress with areport that identifies
and quantifies the nationa benefits of demand response and provides policy recommendations
as to how to achieve specific levels of such benefits by January 1, 2005.”.

(e) DEMAND RESPONSE AND REGIONAL COORDINATION.—

(2) It isthe policy of the United States to encourage States to coordinate, on a regiond
basis, State energy policies to provide reliable and affordable demand response services to the
public.

28



(2) The Secretary of Energy shall provide technica assistance to States and regiond
organizations formed by two or more States to assst them in—

(A) identifying the areas with the greatest demand response potentid;

(B) identifying and resolving problems in transmission and distribution networks,
including through the use of demand response; and

(C) deveoping plans and programs to use demand response to respond to
peak demand or emergency needs.

(3) The Federd Energy Regulatory Commission shdl prepare and publish an annud
report, by appropriate region, that assesses demand response resources, including those
available from dl consumer cdlasses, and which identifies and reviews each of the following:

(A) Saturation and penetration rate of advanced meters and communicetions
technologies, devices and systems.

(B) Exigting demand response programs and time-based rate programs.

(C) The annud resource contribution of demand resources, including the prior
year and following years.

(D) The potentia for demand response as a quantifiable, reliable resource for
regiond planning purposes.

(E) Steps taken to ensure that, in regiond transmission planning and operations,
that demand resources are provided equitable treatment as a quantifiable, reliable
resource relative to the resource obligations of any load-serving entity, transmisson
provider or transmitting party.

(f) Cost Recovery oF DEMAND ResPoNse Devices.—It isthe policy of the United States that
time-based pricing and other forms of demand response, whereby eectricity customers are provided
with eectricity price sgnds and the ability to benefit by responding to them, shal be encouraged and the
deployment of such technology and devices that enable eectricity customers to participate in such
pricing and demand response systems shall be facilitated. It isfurther the policy of the United States
that the benefits of such demand response that accrue to those not deploying such technology and

29



devices, but who are part of the same regiona eectricity entity, shall be recognized.
SEC._ 54. ADOPTION OF ADDITIONAL STANDARDS.
(a) AbopTioN oF STANDARDS.—Section 113(b) of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of

1978 (16 U.S.C. 2623(b)) is amended by adding at the end the following:

“(6) Each dectric utility shdl provide distributed generation, combined heat and power,
and digtrict heating and cooling systems competitive access to the locd distribution grid and
competitive pricing of service, and shal use smplified standard contracts for the interconnection
of generating facilities that have a power production capacity of 250 kilowatts or less.

“(7) No dectric utility may refuse to interconnect a generating facility with the
didribution facdlities of the dectric utility if the owner or operator of the generating facility
complies with technica standards adopted by the State regulatory authority and agrees to pay
the costs established by such State regulatory authority.

“(8) Each dectric utility shall develop a plan to minimize dependence on one fuel source
and to ensure that the eectric energy it sdlsto consumersis generated using a diverse range of
fuds and technologies, including renewable technologies.

“(9) Each dectric utility shal develop and implement atenyear plan to increase the
efficdency of itsfosdl fud generation.”.

(b) Time FOR ADOPTING STANDARDS.—Section 113 of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies
Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2623) is further amended by adding at the end the following:

“(d) SPeciAL RuLE.—For purposes of implementing paragraphs (6), (7), (8), and (9) of
subsection (b), any reference contained in this section to the date of enactment of the Public Utility
Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 shdl be deemed to be a reference to the date of enactment of this

subsection.”.
SEC._ 55. TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.
Section 132(c) of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2642(c)) is

amended to read as follows
“(c) TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE FOR CERTAIN RESPONSIBILITIES.—The Secretary may provide

such technical assistance as determined appropriate to assst State regulatory authorities and electric

30



utilitiesin carrying out their respongbilities under section 111(d)(11) and paragraphs (6), (7), (8), and
(9) of section 113(b).”.
SEC._56. COGENERATION AND SMALL POWER PRODUCTION PURCHASE AND SALE REQUIREMENTS,

(&) TERMINATION OF MANDATORY PURCHASE AND SALE REQUIREMENTS—Section 210 of
the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 824a-3) is amended by adding at the end
thefallowing:

“(m) TERMINATION OF MANDATORY PURCHASE AND SALE REQUIREMENTS.—

“(1) After the date of enactment of this subsection, no dectric utility shal be required to
enter into anew contract or obligation to purchase dectric energy from a qualifying
cogeneration facility or aquaifying smdl power production facility under this section if the
Commission finds that the qualifying cogeneration facility or qudifying smal power production
facility has access to independently administered red time wholesde markets for the sde of
electric energy or long-term wholesale markets for the sale of capacity and dectric energy.

“(2) After the date of enactment of this subsection, no dectric utility shall be required
to enter into anew contract or obligation to purchase ectric energy from aquaifying
cogeneration facility that does not on ayearly average use at least fifty percent of its combined
thermal and dectrica output for commercia or industrial processes or hegting or cooling
goplications.

“(2) After the date of enactment of this subsection, no dectric utility shall be required to
enter into a new contract or obligation to sdl eectric energy to a qudifying cogeneration facility
or aqualifying smal power production facility under this section if competing retall dectric
suppliers are able to provide eectric energy to the qualifying cogeneration facility or qualifying
small power production fecility.

“(3) Nothing in this subsection affects the rights or remedies of any party under any
contract or obligation, in effect or pending gpprova before a State regulatory authority or
nonregulated eectric utility on the date of enactment of this subsection, to purchase dectric
energy or capacity from or to sdll eectric energy or capacity to afacility under this Act
(including the right to recover cogts of purchasing electric energy or capacity).

31



“(4(A) To ensure recovery by an dectric utility that purchases electric energy or
cgpacity from a qualifying facility pursuant to any legaly enforceable obligetion entered into or
imposed under this section, of dl prudently incurred costs associated with the purchases, the
Commission shall issue and enforce such regulations as may be required to ensure that the
eectric utility shall collect the prudently incurred costs associated with such purchases.

“(B) A regulation under subparagraph (A) shall be enforcegble in accordance with the
provisions of law gpplicable to enforcement of regulations under the Federa Power Act (16
U.S.C. 791aet seq.).”.

(b) ELIMINATION OF OWNERSHIP LIMITATIONS.—

(2) Section 3(17)(C) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 796(17)(C)) is amended to
read asfollows:

“(C) *qudifying smdl power production facility’ meansasmal power production facility
that the Commission determines, by rule, meets such requirements (including requirements
respecting minimum size, fud use, and fud efficiency) as the Commission may, by rule,
prescribe.”.

(2) Section 3(18)(B) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 796(18)(B)) is amended to
read as follows:

“(B) *qudifying cogeneration facility'’ means a cogeneration facility that the Commission
determines, by rule, meets such requirements (including requirements respecting minimum sze,
fud use, and fud efficiency) as the Commisson may, by rule, prescribe.”.

Subtitle G—Market Transparency, Anti-Manipulation And
Enfor cement

SEC._ 61. MARKET TRANSPARENCY RULES.
Part 11 of the Federa Power Act isamended by adding after section 2 as added by this Act

the fallowing:
“MARKET TRANSPARENCY RULES

“Sec. 2__. (a) Not later than 180 days after the date of enactment of this section, the

32



Commission shall issue rules establishing an eectronic information system to provide the Commisson
and the public with access to such information asis necessary or gppropriate to facilitate price
trangparency and participation in markets subject to the Commission’sjurisdiction. Such systems shal
provide information about the availability and market price of wholesde dectric energy and transmisson
sarvices to the Commisson, State commissions, buyers and sdlers of wholesde electric energy, users of
transmission sarvices, and the public on a quarterly basis. The Commission shdl have authority to
obtain such information from any eectric and trangmitting utility, including any entity described in section
201(f).

“(b) The Commission shdl exempt from disclosure information it determines would, if disclosed,

be detrimenta to the operation of an effective market.”.
SEC._62. MARKET MANIPULATION.
Part |1 of the Federal Power Act isamended by the following:
“PROHIBITION ON FILING FALSE INFORMATION
“Sec. 221. It shdl be aviolation of this Act for any person or any other entity willfully and

knowingly to report any information relaing to the price of dectricity sold a wholesde, which
informetion the person or any other entity knew to be false at the time of the reporting, to any

governmenta entity with the intent to manipulate the data being compiled by such governmenta entity.
“PROHIBITION ON ROUND TRIP TRADING
“Sec. 222. (g) It shdl be aviolation of this Act for any person or any other entity willfully and

knowingly to enter into any contract or other arrangement to execute a ‘ round-trip trade’ for the
purchase or sdle of dectric energy a wholesale.
“(b) For the purposes of this section, the term ‘round trip trade’ means a transaction, or
combination of transactions, in which a person or any other entity—
“(1) entersinto a contract or other arrangement to purchase from, or sdll to, any other
person or other entity electric energy a wholesale;
“(2) amultaneoudy with entering into the contract or arrangement described in
paragraph (1), arranges afinancidly offsetting trade with such other person or entity for the
same such eectric energy, a the same location, price, quantity and terms so that, collectively,

33



the purchase and sdle transactions in themsalves result in no financia gain or loss, and
“(3) entersinto the contract or arrangement with the intent to deceptively affect reported
revenues, trading volumes, or prices.”.
SEC.__63. ENFORCEMENT.
(a) CompLAINTS—Section 306 of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 825¢) is amended by—

(1) inserting “eectric utility (including entities described in section 201(f) and rurd
cooperative entities),” after “Any person,”; and
(2) inserting “tranamitting utility,” after “licenseg’ each place it appears.
(b) INvESTIGATIONS—Section 307(a) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 825f(a)) is
amended by insarting “or tranamitting utility” after “any person” in the first sentence.
(¢) RevieEw OF CommissioN OrRDERs—Section 313(a) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C.
8251) isamended by inserting “dectric utility,” after “Any person,” in the first sentence.
(d) CRIMINAL PeENALTIES.—Section 316 of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 8250) is
amended—
(1) in subsection (a), by striking “$5,000" and inserting “$1,000,000”, and by striking
“two years’ and inserting “five years’;
(2) in subsection (b), by striking “$500” and inserting “$25,000”; and
(3) by striking subsection ().
(e) CiviL PenaLTIES.—Section 316A of the Federa Power Act (16 U.S.C. 8250-1) is
amended—
(1) in subsections (a) and (b), by striking “section 211, 212, 213, or 214" each placeiit
gppears and inserting “Part 11”; and
(2) in subsection (b), by striking “$10,000” and inserting “$1,000,000".
(f) GENERAL PENALTIES.—Section 21 of the Natural Gas Act (15 U.S.C. 717t) is amended—
(1) in subsection (), by striking “$5,000” and inserting “$1,000,000”, and by striking
“two years’ and inserting “five years ; and
(2) in subsection (b), by striking **$500"" and inserting ‘* $50,000"".
SEC._ 64. REFUND EFFECTIVE DATE.



Section 206(b) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824e(b)) is amended by—

(1) dtriking “the date 60 days after the filing of such complaint nor later than 5 months
after the expiration of such 60-day period” in the second sentence and inserting “the date of the
filing of such complaint nor later than 5 months after the filing of such complaint”;

(2) dtriking “60 days after” in the third sentence and inserting “of”;

(3) driking “expiration of such 60-day period” in the third sentence and inserting
“publicetion date’; and

(4) griking the fifth sentence and insarting: “If no find decison isrendered by the
conclusion of the 180-day period commencing upon initiation of a proceeding pursuant to this
section, the Commission shall Sate the reasons why it has failed to do so and shdl sate its best

estimate as to when it reasonably expects to make such decision.”.
SEC._ 65. SANCTITY OF CONTRACT.
(& LimITATION ON AUTHORITY.—The Federal Energy Regulatory Commission shdl have no

authority to abrogate or modify any provision of an existing contract, except upon afinding, after notice
and opportunity for a hearing, that such action is necessary to protect the public interest, unless such
contract expresdy provides for a different standard of review.
(b) JurisbicTioN.—For purposes of this section, an existing contract is any agreement, in effect
and subject to the jurisdiction of the Commisson—
(1) under section 4 of the Naturd Gas Act or section 205 of the Federa Power Act;
and

(2) that is not for salesin an organized exchange or auction spot market.

Subtitle H—Consumer Protections

SEC.__71. INFORMATION DISCLOSURE.

(8) DiscLosure RuLEs.—Not later than 180 days after the date of enactment of this Act, the
Federd Trade Commission shdl issue rules prescribing the form, content, placement, and timing of the
disclosure required under subsections (b) and (c) of thissection. Therulesshdl beissued in
accordance with section 553 of title 5, United States Code, after consultation with the Federal Energy

35



Regulatory Commission, the Secretary of Energy, and the Adminigtrator of the Environmenta Protection
Agency.

(b) DiscLosurE TO ELECTRIC CONSUMERS—In order to assist eectric consumersin making
informed purchasing decisions, an dectric utility that sells or makes an offer to sell dectric energy, or
solicits dectric consumers to purchase eectric energy, shdl provide the eectric consumer, in
accordance with rues issued under subsection (a), a statement containing—

(1) the nature of the service being offered, including information about interruptibility of
service;

(2) the price of the dectric energy, including a description of any variable charges;

(3) adescription of al other charges associated with the service being offered, including
access charges, exit charges, back-up service charges, stranded cost recovery charges, and
customer service charges, and

(4) information the Federd Trade Commission determinesis technologicaly and
economicdly feasible to provide, is of assstance to dectric consumers in making purchasing
decisions, and concerns—

(A) the product or its price,

(B) the share of dectric energy that is generated by each type of eectric
generation resource, and

(C) the generation emissions characteristics of the eectric energy.

(c) DiscLosURE TO WHOLESALE PURCHASERS—IN every sale of dectric energy for resale, the
sdler shdl provide to the purchaser the information respecting generation source and emissions
characterigtics required by rulesissued under subsection (a).

(d) FEDERAL TRADE CoMMISSION ENFORCEMENT.—Violaion of arule issued under this
section shall be treated as aviolation of arule under section 18 of the Federal Trade Commisson Act
(15U.S.C. 57a). All functions and powers of the Federa Trade Commission under the Federd Trade
Commission Act are available to the Federd Trade Commission to enforce compliance with this section

notwithstanding any jurisdictiond limitations in the Federd Trade Commission Act.

36



(e) StaTE AuTHORITY.—This section does not preclude a State regul atory authority from
issuing and enforcing additiona laws, regulations, or procedures regarding the practices that are the

subject of this section.
SEC.__72. CONSUMER PRIVACY.
The Federd Trade Commission shall issue rules protecting the privacy of eectric consumers

from the disclosure of consumer information in connection with the sale or delivery of eectric energy to
aretall dectric consumer. The Federa Trade Commissions shall proceed in accordance with section

553 of title 5 of the United States Code, when prescribing a rule under this section.
SEC.__73.UNFAIR TRADE PRACTICES.
(& SLAMMING.—The Federd Trade Commission shadl issue rules prohibiting the change of

selection of an dectric utility except with the informed consent of the electric consumer or if determined
by the appropriate State regulatory authority to be necessary to prevent loss of service.

(b) CRAMMING.—The Federd Trade Commission shal issue rules prohibiting the sde of goods
and sarvices to an dectric consumer unless expresdy authorized by law or the eectric consumer.

(¢) RuLEMAKING.—The Federa Trade Commission shall proceed in accordance with section

553 of title 5, United States Code, when prescribing arule under this section.
SEC._ 74.DEFINITIONS.
For purposes of this subtitle—

(1) “State commission” has the meaning given that term in section 3(15) of the Federd
Power Act (16 U.S.C. 796(15)),

(2) “dectric consumer” and “dectric utility” have the meanings given those termsin
section 3 of the Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2602), and

(3) “locd digtribution company” means any entity that owns, contrals, or operates local
digtribution facilities.

Subtitle |—Technical Amendments
SEC._ 81. TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS.

(&) Section 211(c) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824j(c)) is amended by—

(1) striking “(2)';

37



(2) griking “(A)” and inserting “(2)™
(3) griking “(B)” and inserting “(2)”; and
(4) dgriking “termination of modification” and inserting “termination or modification”.
(b) Section 211(d)(1) of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 824j(d)) is amended by striking
“dectric utility” the second time it gppears and inserting “tranamitting utility”.
(c) Section 315 of the Federal Power Act (16 U.S.C. 825n) is amended by striking
“aubsection” and inserting “ section”.

38



